11

Calendar No. 608
101 CONGRIZS:S H. Ro 1 195

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

Marcr 27, 2007
Received; read twice and referred to the Committee on Environment and
Public Works
Marco 7, 2008
Reported by Mrs. BOXER, with an amendment

[Strike out all after the enacting clause and insert the part printed in italic]

AN ACT

To amend the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient Trans-
portation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users to make tech-
nical corrections, and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
2 tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
3 FHIFEE I—-HIGHWAY PROVISIONS
4 SEC. 101. SURFACE TRANSPORTATION TECHNICAL COR-
5 RECTIONS.



O o0 N N B W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
N A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

2
able: Hexible: Bfficient Fransportation Bawity Aet: A
able: Hexible: Bfficient Fransportation Bawity Aet: A
Seetion 19 of the Safes Acconntable: Flexible: Bfficient
vear shalt be nsed by the Seeretary of Aorieuttare to

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W BB W =

[\O T \© R (O R S e e e e e e e T
Vo= OO0 0 NN A WD = O

23
24
25

Q
(3}

the < of straetine inbainine rephicine:

tatton Hemity Aet: A Legaey for Heers (9 Stat: 1205)

*HR 1195 RS



4

4 respeetively

5

O o0 3

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

Hited States Code; is amended by addine at the end the

“‘?()’ I IEQP&\I["IEV'WQV'WI(’P SNEVSVVIWIW‘ISW !'IQ? %(ilﬂ
T [ J — [ [N PAB UN -

anet projects destened to preserve eapaetty and
elades—

*HR 1195 RS



-

B)

[E—

{er
25 Seetton HT of title 23; United States Code; 18 amended—

O o0 9 AN U B~ W

[\ I NS R T e e T e T e T e D e e T
—_— O O o0 N N O nm R WD = O

NS T\
W N

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W =

|\ I N© R NG T NS R NS R L e T e T e D e e e T
A LW PO = O VWV 0 N O R WD = O

6

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W =

O TN NG T N T NG I NS R NS R N e e T e e T e T e T T
b A W D= O O NN NN R, WD = O

7

PEACEMENT AND REHABHFFATION

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W B W =

NN NN = e = e e s e e =
A~ LW NN R O 0 N WD = O

8
) in paracraph (2} of subseetion () (as
Sreplacetnent and rehbabilitation™

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

9
1 subsection BBy by steikine e Na-
tert Roundk of one of nettenss Byseres thder prrea-
=
Secttor H2m of Htbe 237 Frited States Codes s wend-
yeheh s e

*HR 1195 RS



10
riod at the end:
Seettorr 60HH3) of tite 237 Tntted States Code; s
—Bﬂ'd%—“ a,”.
GHAPHICAL FRRoks —

O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

Hoeak—

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W =

O TN NG T N TR NG I NG I N R N e T e e T e T e T T
b A W D= O 0 NN NN R, WD = O

11
and
B} $35:000;000 for each of fiseal years
wity Aet: A Leeney for Users (49 Stat- 1217) is amended
by addine at the end the followine:

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W kA W =

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e T T
b A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

12
ander ehapter 1 of title 23; United States Code; exeept
of & projeet to be earrted out with sueh funds shall be
80 pereent=
CANCE AND NATIONAL CGCORRIDOR INFRA-
STRUCTURE IMPROVEMENT PROJECTS.

*HR 1195 RS



13

1 SEC. 104. IDLING REDUCTION FACILITIES.

2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

peated:

road mmprovement projeet
deseription ahd tsertire “hrprovettents o of we-

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W B W

N N NS S R S S e e - T S S S
AW N = ©O O 0 N O ML BN WD = O

14

ments at Belleville and Beorse Roads and approach

from Rushing Drive Nowrth to  Grand Aves

Villismson Comntr™

chanee at 1-65; from existing SR—09 to 1652
tion amd Hserting “Desien: riokt-ofwr amd

eonstrnetion of Nebraska Higlway 35 between Now-

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N BB W =

[\© TN NG T N T NS R NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e T e T
L A W D= O O NN NN R, WD = O

15
haneriment of the Fillnore Avenue Corvidor, Buis
ERPCN
deseription and msertine “$400;000 to econduet New
ress Park aeeess road™

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W =

| \O JEE \© R \O R \O R O B e e e e e T e e e e
A LW PO = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

16

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS R T e T e e T e T e T T
L A W D= OO NN N N, WD = O

17
work at Iitte Susitha River Acecess road in
Attale County District 4 (Roads 4211 and 4204

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W =

(\) [\ [\ (\9) N —_ —_ — — p— p— [ [ [ [

18
12th Avene to CSAH 13; ineludine bridee and ap-
prvite roadss and the transfer of eatlto-teaek for
tine Latine Quarter transit plazas at Normandie
engineering,  aequisiton; and  construction  of

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W =

[\© TN NG I N T NG I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e e
b A W D= OO NN NN R, WD = O

19
project description and inserting <P e

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W B W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NS I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
b A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

20
Arventes

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W

O TN NG T N T NS I NG R NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
b A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

21
Rottte o Fahrmann Bowdevards and a bridee eon-
the fnner Harbor™

of 1-65 from approximately 950 feet south of the
Hurdine Place interehanse south to Hooan Road:
the stady of alternatives alone the North South Cor-

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W B W =

[\© TN NG T N T NS R NS R NS R T e T e e T e T e Y Y =
N A W D= O O NN NN R, WD = O

22
Route 5; Fohrmann Boulevard; and a bridee eon-
the Inner Harbor™
ettty of Miamt Beael™s and “$620;000°5 respeetively;
Rosedate Avente and constraetine a new fast Cam-

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W B W

[\© TN NG T N TR NG R NS I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
L A W D= OO0 NN N N R, WD = O

23

tprovement and enhaneement projeets on or hear

(69} i Hem mumber 2430 by striking “200
chanoe’
“$264-0007 and mserting “$644:0007%
Hiprovements—
B 20
41900002 and inserting “$220-060
2030;

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N BB W =

| \O JEE \© R O R O B O B e e e e e T e e e
A W N = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

44 bR * : . 6l I3 2
£33 - and msertine “$13; - :

14 53 ) . R 1] )
sH606- and msertine ~$15000; .

144 » b2 * SR Ll )
= ; afd Hserte “$1 - .

X ) M . [ 3=¢ )
$40; and mserting —$50; .

14 ) b . Y34 2
$ - and msertine —$500; :

44 £ b : : Ll < b2
$15 - and msertine “$2; - :

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W B W =

[\O N \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W = O O 0N N R WD = O

25
project deseription and insertine “Blimination of
project deseription and insertine “Rehabilitation of

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N Bk W =

[\© TN NG N N T NG I NS I NS R N e e T e e T e T e T T
b A W D= OO NN NN B, WD = O

26
stttk et P et

blace? and mserting “Repairs
phiee and insertine “Rehabiitatel

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W Bk W -

O TN NG T N TR NG I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e T T
b A W D= O 0 NN NN R, WD = O

27
appronches” after “eapaeityl
provetents 1o NI TOth Sireet/ NI T9Hh Perrace

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W =

| \O 2N \© R O R \O I O B e e e e e T e e e e
A LW PO = O VWV 0 N o R WD = O

28
projeet deseription and imsertine “Constraet im-
east s

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W B W =

| \O I \© R O R NS N O R T e e e T e T e e e e
A LW O = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

29
near the Dunmoere School eomplex” after “roadsay
redesten’™s

3<’ to ]‘77&&61&44 q 3 ] k.,a 777

Street from Stark Street to the township hne at

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W Bk W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG R NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
b A W D= O O NN NN R, WD = O

30

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W =

[\© TN NG N N T NG I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e T T
b A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

31
Metpsot Steeets P Aventtes Powell Steeets Jose-
Boreueh; Lackawanna County™

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N D B W =

| \O JEE \© R O R \O B O B T e e e e T e e e e
A LW PO = O VWV 0 N O R WD = O

32
Frzerne Cotnty
Connty™;

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N D Bk W =

N N S S R S S e e S S S S
AW N = ©O VO 0 N O M B WD = O

33
Wilkes-Barre to desion; acquire land; and eonstruet
roadiway redesien at and around the Sterling Hotel
Street; or Frankhn  Street {or any  combinmtion
thereof) to the wieinity of the Irem Temple? and
“44-000-0007 and by insertine “$3-150.0002

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N D B W =

|\ I N© TR NG I NS R NS R e T e T e T e e T
A LW PO = O VOV 0 N O W kA WD = O

34
Feeate™
. J&Ei(iﬁ”,
project deseription and serting “Constraet sotmnd

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W =

[\© TN NG I N T NS R NG R N R N e T e e T e T e T T
b A W D= O 0 NN NN R, WD = O

35

projeet deseription and inserting “Conduet a stady

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W BB W =

| \O JEE \© R \© R \O I O B e e e e e T e e e e
A LW PO = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

36
San Gabrels
San Gabriels
San Gabriels
Phase HRart I of a projeet on Elizabeth Avenne 1

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W B W =

[\© TN NG T N T NS I NG R NS R N e T e e T e T e T T
b A W D= OO NN NN R, WD = O

37
oo
Prath Newton Cotntys
projeet deseription and msertine “Conduet a projeet

*HR 1195 RS



O 00 N O W R~ WY

[\ TN NG T N T NG I NS N NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
hnh A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

38
Barrineton  and strectseape Huprovetnents to
Hotse Pike to NoJ Turnpike overpass it Barrinoton”

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W B W

O TN NG I N T NG I NG I NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
b A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

39
ship?s

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W Bk W =

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG R NS R T e T e e T e T e T Y =
b A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

40
eesttion; and constraction of & parking earage;

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W

|\ I N© R NG T NS R S R e T e T e T e T T W
A LW PO = O VOV 0 N O wn P WD = O

41
tvelys

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N BB W =

[\ TN NG T N T NG I NS N N R N e T e e T e T e e
b A W D= OO NN NN R, WD = O

42

44 b
E ) )

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N BB W =

| \O 2R \© R \O R O B O B e e e e e T e e e e
A W D= O O 0NN N N R WD = O

43

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W B W =

[\© TN NG N N T NS I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e T T
b A W D= O 0 NN NN R, WD = O

44
project deseription and insertihe “Preliminary de-
natives to TH 36/SH 64 St Croix River Crossine
trind  sites i the eities of MeKeesport and

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N BB W =

[\© TN NG TN N T NS I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e T T
L A W D= O 0 NN NN R, WD = O

45
prevements and uperades related to the Penmsyl-
speetivelys

ship? aned tserting “sonth to the eity of Ttiea’s
right-of-way acqrisition of TH 244 6SAH 35 and
assoeiated streets i the ety of St Miehaels

of €5X RR Bridge? and inserting “US Highway

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N BB W =

|\ JEE O R NS R O IR O R . T T S S S S N e
A LW PO = O VWV 0 N O R WD = O

46

*HR 1195 RS



O O N O U A W N =

N N S ST S B e e T e e e e ey
A W DD = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

47
CSAH? interchanse and CSAH2 corridor to TH6T
streteh of BIA Route 4 from the junction of the BEA

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W B W =

|\ I N© R NG T NS I NS R e T e T e D e e e T
A LW O = O VOV 0 N O wn kA WD = O

48
wretion” and insertine “orecon: jon Gnehiding
ton
atott colmns and msertine “PAS “Constraetion
of & bridee over Brandywine Creek as part of the
SpringsT atd “$520:0007 respeetively;

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N BB W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
L A W D= OO0 NN N N R, WD = O

49
“$990 0007 pes el
S0 i Hsertie A2

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W B W =

O TN NG T N T NS I NG R NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
b A W D= OO NN NN R, WD = O

50
sthility of a tunnel alternative to elose the 110 ree-

*HR 1195 RS



1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8

9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

531

thortty or fandine is repealed or redueed;

redtreeds and

*HR 1195 RS



D2

3

O© o0 9 N »n B~

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

Center-
pose & tax on the removal of taxable fuael from any
& tax on the removal of taxable fuel from any refin-
minak
a State or loeal eovernment {as defined i seetton

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W BB W

—
o = O

13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

53

& eertifteation system by a State of any fuel sold to
& nonprofit edueational oreanization {as defined m
GRAM.

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W Bk W =

[\O I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e D e e
W N = O O 0N N RN = O

54
Seetion 1908} of the Safe; Accountable: Fexible;
Bificient Fransportation Benity Aet: & Leeney for Hsers
Seetion 1909} of the Sefe: Aeceonntable: Mexible:
Bfficient Transportation Beaity Aet: A Leoney for Hsers
serting “Deecember 31 20045
3} 1 paragraph HHHDHD by stetkne =5 on &

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W B W

|\ I N© TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e T e e T
A LW O = O VWV 0 N O R WD = O

55
to or shared with other eommissions or task forees
A Feenes for Hsers (9 Stats H84 15 amended—

*HR 1195 RS



56
only apphed to components or parts of a bridee

[E—

19 “52:000:0007 and mserting “$3;000;000-

20 SEC. 111. BIA INDIAN ROAD PROGRAM.

21 Seetion 1939 of the Sate, Acentntables Iexible,
23 9 Stat 151 18 amended—

24 11 by stetkinge o the villaoes™ and insertinge
25 the followine:

O o0 9 AN U B~ W

e T e S e e S S e e
o N O W kA W NN = O

*HR 1195 RS



D7
sertine & pertod and the followine:

O o0 N N B W =

e N SO =
W N = O

—_—
|, BN SN

Seetion 1961 of the Safe; Accountable: Flexible, Bffi-

DO = = e e
S O 0 NN A

23 “ny Drstenc—The Seeretary shall make svailable
24 the fands suthorized to be approprinted by this seetion

[\OJE \)
N =

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W B W =

O TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
b A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

58
seetton (b and
and

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N BB W =

[\O T \© R (O R R e e e e e e e T
o= OO0 0 NN AW = O

23

Aet:
ed—

09

SH69F000007 and o that foHews threueh
atet
pereent— the followte “orr # the ease of frinds
centl

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W B W =

O TN NG T N TR NG I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
b A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

60
tles

been enacted:
D at least $1-000-000 shall be made available
for ench of fiseal vears 2007 throueh 2009 to earry
and

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W =

e T S N S T e T = T = T
O o0 N O »n B~ W N = O

20
21
22
23
24
25

61
2} at least $4-900-000 shall be made avatlable
for ench of fiseal vears 2007 throueh 2009 to earry
we et Y feoner for Hsers (HY State 1929 i
CATION —".

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG I NG R N e T e e T e T e e T
L A W D= OO NN NN R, WND = O

62
1 reetires a nonprofit nstitation of hieher learn-
Hon'=

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W BB W =

[\© TN NG N N T NG I NS R NS R T e T e T e T e T e T W =
b A W D= O 0 NN NN R, WD = O

63
SEC. 116. DEFINITION OF REPEAT INTOXICATED DRIVER
EAW:
A peeetre—
not less than 1 year; or
of the suspenston pertod followed by & remn-

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W B W =

[\© TN NG I N T NG I NG R NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
hnh A W D= O O NN NN R, WD = O

64
“B7 be subject to the impoundment or -
mobilization of: or the mstallation of an ienition
or operated: or boths by the individuak™

(e y)
Py )

) prbhish 1 the Federad Register a de-

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N D B W =

[\O I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e D e e
(US T O R =N <N e ) ) B O N S =

65

ITY-

shotdders or the laek of a safety showlder i the

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W =

[\© TN NG I N T NG I NG R NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
L A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

66
of that Aet; and

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 9 N U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

67
TITLE II—TRANSIT PROVISIONS
amended—
(A} by insertine Sop the identified phasel
23 Seetton 5303HH2) of such title 13 amended
amended—

*HR 1195 RS



68
() SEeIoN 5309 —Seetion 53090m) of sueh title is
atrended—

[E—

AR and
o) SEerroN 53H—=eetion 5311 of such title 8
amended—

O o0 9 AN U B~ W

[ w—
—_ O

)

EXpeRSes—;
e shections ser b med senbabs by
of steh title 15 amended by strikne “MaASs TRANSPOR-
24 Hon S35

[\O I NS R e e e e e D
—_ O O o0 NN N N R~ W

*HR 1195 RS



1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

69

atended—

aretded by stirtkie Sseetton 9990 H2 ahd Hiserthe

atmended—

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W BB W =

[\ TN NG T N T NS I NG R NS R N e T e e T e T e T T
b A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

70
Seettor 5336 of sueh title 18 amended—
SHHT—
seetiotrs fo e GH2Y of seetion 05 and -
of seetion 53382 and
added by seetion 3034(e) of the Safe- Aeeonnt-
3034HAHD) of the Safes Aceonntable Hexible: Bfi-

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e T T
b A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

71
Fsers (HY Stae H2995 5 aiended by strdkine
oy SAFEFEATH—
forptte et 2 Beones for Frers 9 St H65365
At HHY St 3639 i wmmended by strikne
SO H2F of suech Aet (9 Statr 16423 i
“Mallt

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N BB W =

[\© TN NG N N T NG I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e T e T
b A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

72

seetton 3044 of sweh Aet (H9 Stat 16523 i

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W B W =

[\O I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e D e e
W = O O 0 N R, WD = O

*HR 1195 RS

73
areals
to Rieo™s
tesl
to Rieo™s



O o0 N N B W =

| \O JEE \© R O R O N O B T e e e e T e e e
A LW PO = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W =

e T = O =
W NN = O

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

75
Iinistration: transfer facilities
Mlentown, Pernsylvanial.

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W B W =

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e T e e e T
A LW O = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

76
TITEE ITH—OTHER PROVISIONS
SEC: 301. TECHNICAL AMENDMENTS RELATING TO MOTOR
CARRIER SAFETY.
Fhited States Code; is amended by strikine the destena-
evaph (2):

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W B W =

|\ I N© TR NG T NS R NS R L e T e T e T e e e T
A LW PO = O VWV 0 N O R WD = O

77
of sueh et (119 Stat, 18993 s amended by strikine
HIHeHD of the steh Aet 39 Stats 17263 15 amended
sy
By i e b striking RIS el fnsertiog
1734) 1 amended by striking “heense and msertine “h-

)

eenses—

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W =

[\© TN NG N N T NG I NG R NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
b A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

78
A aam s
tion 39 of ehapter 2 of title 18; United States Code; relat-
et of 20057 and

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W

O TN NG T N T NG I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
b A W D= O O NN N N R, WD = O

79
-
ahy fihhe or pay any fee to a State with respeet to the
termihe the stre of a motor earrier or motor private ear-
rier’s fleet i ealenlating the fee to be paid by & motor

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

80
Seettonr HB0dalteH 2} of Hthe 49; Hnited States Code; s
+9; Fited Stetes Codes s aetded—
HE06HH2 of titde 495 Frted States Codes s attended
ot tder o apphesble State hie #y onr Oetober 35 20067
the State has a form of hiehway use taxation not stbjeet

*HR 1195 RS



81
2 tent s
49; United States Code; 1s amended—

O© o0 9 N W B~

10 B by strikine “drive-away saddlemount
12 savcleblerennt s ad

13 H by tsertitte “Sueh cottbiton e
14 thelrde one falmount? after the pertod at the
15 et

16 2N sENERAL —Seetion ST B LD of
18 saddienonnt with fidbnownt™  and dnsertine . all
19 driveaway saddlemount’™

20 SEC. 302. TECHNICAL AMENDMENTS RELATING TO HAZ-
21 ARDOUS MATERIALS TRANSPORTATION.

22 o PErprtoNy oF Haair Brhoyiis—Seetion
23 922} of the Safe; Aeeountables Fexible; $ffietent
24 Pransportation Fauity Aets A Leomey o Psers THY Siat
25 1RHE) s amended—

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W =

[\© TN NG N N T NG I NG N NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
b A W D= O 0 NN NN R, WD = O

82
AHBate BB of tide 490 Paited States Codes i
“§ 5128. Autherization of apprepriations’
A1 of titde 490 Piited States Codes is amended in the e

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W=

O TN NG TN N T NS I NS R NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
L A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

83
+9; Fited Stetes Codes s aetded—
i NTPRB FHH of
RS NI

ttor 402(e) of the title 23; United States Code; 18 amended
ot be less than one-half of 1 per centum and inserting

*HR 1195 RS



84

2 than three-gquarters of T pereent’™

3

O o0 9 N W A~

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

D Seetion 2002(b) of the Safe; Aceountable;
B by steikine “and? at the end of sub-
ey relatine to administeation expenses and sub-

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[\ TR NO T N B NG T NG I NS R NS R e e T e e e T e T
A N A WD = O 0O 0NN B W N~ O

85

TATION COMMISSION:
et are repeateds
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Highway Technical Cor-
rections Act of 2007
SEC. 2. SURFACE TRANSPORTATION TECHNICAL CORREC-

TIONS.

(a) CORRECTION OF INTERNAL REFERENCES IN DIS-
ADVANTAGED  BUSINESS — ENTERPRISES.—Paragraphs
(3)(A) and (5) of section 1101(b) of the Safe, Accountable,
Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for
Users (119 Stat. 1156) are amended by striking “paragraph
(1)” each place it appears and inserting “paragraph (2)”.

(b) CORRECTION OF DISTRIBUTION OF OBLIGATION
AUTHORITY.—Section 1102(¢c)(5) of the Safe, Accountable,
Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for

Users (119 Stat. 1158) is amended by striking “among the

States”.
(¢) CORRECTION OF FEDERAL LANDS HIGHWAYS.—
Section 1119 of the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient

Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (119 Stat.

*HR 1195 RS



1
2
3
4

O o0 9 O W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

86

1190) 1s amended by striking subsection (m) and inserting

the following:
“(m) FOREST HIGOWAYS.—Of the amounts made
available for public lands highways under section 1101—

“(1) not more than $20,000,000 for each fiscal
year may be used for the maintenance of forest high-
ways;

“(2) not more than $1,000,000 for each fiscal
year may be used for signage identifying public hunt-
g and fishing access; and

“(3) mot more than $10,000,000 for each fiscal
year shall be used by the Secretary of Agriculture to
pay the costs of facilitating the passage of aquatic
species beneath forest roads (as defined in section
101(a) of title 23, Unated States Code), including the
costs of constructing, maintarning, replacing, and re-
moving culverts and bridges, as appropriate.”.

(d) CORRECTION OF DESCRIPTION OF NATIONAL COR-
RIDOR INFRASTRUCTURE IMPROVEMENT PROJECT—Item
number 1 of the table contained in section 1302(e) of the
Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation Eq-
wity Act: A Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1205) 1s amended
i the State column by inserting “LA,” after “TX,”.

(¢) CORRECTION OF INFRASTRUCTURE FINANCE SEC-

TION.—Section 1602(d)(1) of the Safe, Accountable, Flexi-

*HR 1195 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N e

O TN NG I N T NG I NG I NG R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG O N N = = N Re - BN B e ) W ) B ~SU O TR NO I e

87
ble, Efficient Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for
Users (119 Stat. 1247) is amended by striking “through 189
as sections 601 through 609, respectively” and inserting
“through 190 as sections 601 through 610, respectively”.

(f) CORRECTION OF PROJECT FEDERAL SHARE.—Sec-
tion 1964(a) of the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient
Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (119 Stat.
1519) 1s amended—

(1) by striking “only for the States of Alaska,
Montana, Nevada, North Dakota, Oregon, and South
Dakota,”; and

(2) by striking “section 120(b)” and inserting
“section 1207
(9) TRANSPORTATION SYSTEMS MANAGEMENT AND

OPERATIONS DEFINED.—Section 101(a) of title 23, United
States Code, 1s amended by adding at the end the following:

“(39) TRANSPORTATION SYSTEMS MANAGEMENT
AND OPERATIONS.—

“(A) IN GENERAL—The term ‘transpor-
tation  systems management and operations’
means an integrated program to optimize the
performance of existing infrastructure through
the implementation of multimodal and inter-
modal, cross-jurisdictional systems, services, and

projects designed to preserve capacity and im-

*HR 1195 RS



88

1 prove security, safety, and reliability of the
2 transportation system.

3 “(B) INCLUSIONS.—The term ‘transpor-
4 tation systems management and operations’ in-
5 cludes—

6 “(1) regional operations collaboration
7 and coordination activities between trans-
8 portation and public safety agencies; and

9 “(i) 1mprovements to the transpor-
10 tation system, such as traffic detection and
11 surveillance, arterial management, freeway
12 management, demand management, work
13 zone management, emergency management,
14 electronic toll collection, automated enforce-
15 ment, traffic incident management, road-
16 way weather management, traveler infor-
17 mation services, commercial vehicle oper-
18 ations, traffic control, freight management,
19 and coordination of highway, rail, transit,
20 bicycle, and pedestrian operations.”.
21 (h) CORRECTION OF REFERENCE IN APPORTIONMENT

22 orF HIicawAy SAFETY IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM FUNDS.—

23 Effective October 1, 20006, section 104(b)(5)(A)(ii1) of title

24 23 United States Code, 1s amended by striking “the Fed-

*HR 1195 RS



89

1 eral-aid system” each place it appears and inserting “Fed-
2 eral-avd highways™.

3 (i) CORRECTION OF AMENDMENT TO ADVANCE CON-
4 STRUCTION.—RSection 115 of title 23, United States Code,
S s amended by redesignating subsection (d) as subsection
6 (c)

7 (j) CORRECTION OF HIGH PRIORITY PROJECTS.—Sec-
8 tion 117 of title 23, Unated States Code, is amended—

9

(1) by redesignating subsections (d) through (h)

10 as subsections (e) through (i), respectively;

11 (2) by redesignating the second subsection (c)
12 (relating to Federal share) as subsection (d);

13 (3) in subsection (a)(2)(4) by inserting “(112
14 Stat. 257)7 after “21st Century”™; and

15 (4) wn subsection (a)(2)(B)—

16 (A) by striking “subsection (b)” and insert-
17 g “subsection (¢)”’; and

18 (B) by striking “SAFETEA-LU” and in-
19 serting  “Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Kfficient
20 Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users
21 (119 Stat. 1256)”.

22 (k) CORRECTION OF TRANSFER OF UNUSED PROTEC-

23 1ivE-DEVICE FUNDS 1O OTHER HIGHWAY SAFETY 1M-
24 PROVEMENT PROGRAM PROJECTS.—Section 130(e)(2) of

25 title 23, Unated States Code, is amended by striking “pur-

*HR 1195 RS



90

1 poses under this subsection” and inserting “highway safety

2 amprovement program purposes”.

(1) METROPOLITAN TRANSPORTATION PLANNING.—

Section 134 of title 23, Unated States Code, is amended—

(1) in subsection (f)(3)(C)(i1) by striking sub-

clause (II) and inserting the following:

*HR 1195 RS

“(II) FUNDING.—In addition to

Junds made available to the metropoli-

tan planning organization for the Lake
Tahoe region under other provisions of
this title and chapter 53 of title 49,
prior to an allocation under section
202 of this title, the Secretary shall set
aside /> of 1 percent of funds author-
1zed to be appropriated to carry out
that section, which shall be provided to
the Tahoe Metropolitan Planning Or-
ganization to carry out the transpor-
tation planning process, including the
environmental review of transportation
projects to complete environmental doc-
umentation for the Lake Tahoe region
under the Tahoe Regional Planning

Compact as consented to in Public



O o0 N N D Bk W =

O TN NG T N T NG N NG I NG B e e T e e T e T e e T
[ N N O N N = = NN - BN B o) W ) B ~S O I NO S e

91
Law 96551 (94 Stat. 3233) and this

subparagraph.”;

(2) in subsection (j)(3)(D) by inserting “or the
wdentified phase” after “the project” each place it ap-
pears; and

(3) wn subsection (k)(2) by striking “a metropoli-
tan planning area serving’.

(m) CORRECTION OF HIGHWAY BRIDGE PROGRAM.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—RSection 144 of title 23,
United States Code, 1s amended—

(A) i the section heading by striking “re-
placement and rehabilitation’;

(B) in subsections (b), (¢c)(1), and (e) by
striking “Federal-aid system”™ each place it ap-
pears and inserting “Federal-avd highway’;

(C) wn subsections (¢)(2) and (o) by striking
“the Federal-aid system” each place it appears
and inserting “Federal-aid highways’;

(D) in the heading to paragraph (4) of sub-
section (d) by inserting “SYSTEMATIC” before
“PREVENTIVE”,

(E) in subsection (e) by striking “off-system
bridges” each place it appears and inserting
“bridges not on Federal-aid highways”;

(F) by striking subsection (f);

*HR 1195 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

O TN NG I N T NG I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e T T
[ N N O N N e = N Re - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O B NO S e

92

(G) by redesignating subsections (g) through
(s) as subsections (f) through (r), respectively;

(H) in subsection (f) (as redesignated by
subparagraph (G))—

(1) in paragraph (1)(A)—

(I) in clause (vi), by inserting
except that any unobligated or unex-
pended funds remaining upon comple-
tion of the project under this clause
shall be transferrved to and wused to
carry out the project described in
clause (viv)” after “Vermont”; and

(Il) in clause (viwe), by inserting
“and corridor” after “bridge”; and
(11) n paragraph (2), by striking the

paragraph heading and inserting “BRIDGES

NOT ON FEDERAL-AID IHIGHTWAYS;

(I) wn subsection (m) (as redesignated by
subparagraph (G)) by striking the subsection
heading and inserting “PROGRAM FOR BRIDGES
NOT ON FEDERAL-AID HIGHWAYS”; and

(J) in subsection (n)(4)(B) (as redesignated
by subparagraph (G)) by striking “State high-
way agency’ and inserting “State transpor-

tation department”.

*HR 1195 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\© TN O T N T NG I NG I NG B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ N N N N N = = NN - BN B o) W ) B ~S O TR NO U e

93

(2) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—

(A)  METROPOLITAN  PLANNING.—Section
104(f)(1) of title 23, United States Code, 1is
amended by striking “replacement and rehabili-
tation”.

(B) EQUITY BONUS PROGRAM.—Subsections
(a)(2)(C) and (b)(2)(C) of section 105 of title 23,
United States Code, are amended by striking
“replacement and rehabilitation” each place vt
appears.

(C) ANALYSIS.—The analysis for chapter 1
of title 23, United States Code, 1s amended in
the item relating to section 144 by striking “‘re-
placement and rehabilitation™.

(n) CORRECTION OF NATIONAL SCENIC BYWAYS PRO-
GRAM COVERAGE.—Section 162 of title 23, United States
Code, 1s amended—

(1) in subsection (a)(3)(B) by striking “a Na-
tional Scenic Byway under subparagraph (A)” and
mserting “a National Scenic Byway, an All-Amer-
ican Road, or one of America’s Biyways under para-
graph (1)”; and

(2) in subsection (c)(3) by striking “or All-Amer-
ican Road” each place it appears and inserting “All-

American Road, or one of America’s Byways”.

*HR 1195 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N -

[\© TN O I N T NG I NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N O N N = = NN - BN B o) W ) B ~S O I NO S e

94

(0) CORRECTION OF REFERENCE IN TOLL PROVI-
SION.—RSection 166(b)(5)(C) of title 23, United States Code,
1s amended by striking “paragraph (3)” and inserting
“paragraph (4)”.

(p) CORRECTION OF RECREATIONAL TRAILS PROGRAM
APPORTIONMENT EXCEPTIONS.—Section 206(d)(3)(A) of
title 2.3, United States Code, s amended by striking “(B),
(C), and (D) and inserting “(B) and (C)”.

(q) CORRECTION OF INFRASTRUCTURE FINANCE.—
Section 601(a)(3) of title 23, United States Code, is amend-
ed by inserting “Dbb minus, BBB (low),” after “Baa3,”

(r) CORRECTION OF MISCELLANEOUS TYPOGRAPHICAL
ERRORS.—

(1) Section 1401 of the Safe, Accountable, Flexi-
ble, Efficient Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy
for Users (119 Stat. 1226) is amended by redesig-
nating subsections (d) and (e) as subsections (¢) and
(d), respectively.

(2) Section 1404(e) of such Act (119 Stat. 1229)
1s amended by inserting “tribal,” after “local,”.

(3) Section 10211(b)(2) of such Act (119 Stat.
1937) is amended by striking “plan administer” and
mserting “plan and administer”.

(4) Section 10212(a) of such Act (119 Stat.

1937) 1s amended—

*HR 1195 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\ TN NG TN N T NG I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N N N N = = N Re - BN B e ) W ) B ~S O I NO R e

95

(A4) by mserting “equity bonus,” after
“minimum guarantee,”;

(B) by striking ‘freight intermodal connec-
tors” and inserting “‘railway-highway cross-
mygs’’;

(C) by striking “high risk rural road,”; and

(D) by nserting after “highway safety im-
provement programs’ the following: “(and sepa-
rately the set aside for the high risk rural road
program)”’.

SEC. 3. MAGLEYV.

(a) FUNDING.—Section 1101(a)(18) of the Safe, Ac-
countable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity Act: A
Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1155) is amended by striking
subparagraphs (A) and (B) and inserting the following:

“(4) $20,000,000 for fiscal year 2007; and

“(B) $35,000,000 for each of fiscal years
2008 and 2009.”.

(b) CONTRACT AUTHORITY.—Section 1307 of the Safe,
Accountable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity Act:
A Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1217) s amended by adding
at the end the following:

“(e) CONTRACT AUTHORITY.—Funds authorized under
section 1101(a)(18) shall be available for obligation in the

same manner as if the funds were apportioned under chap-

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W =

|\ I N© TR NG I NS R NS R L e e T e T e e T
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = ©

96
ter 1 of title 23, United States Code; except that the funds

shall not be transferable and shall remain available until

expended, and the Federal share of the cost of a project to

be carried out with such funds shall be 80 percent.”.

SEC. 4. PROJECTS OF NATIONAL AND REGIONAL SIGNIFI-
CANCE.

The table contained in section 1301(m) of the Safe, Ac-
countable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity Act: A
Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1203) is amended—

(1) wn ttem number 19 by striking the project de-
seription and inserting “Regional rail expansion and
transportation infrastructure in the vicinity of Santa
Teresa, New Mexico™; and

(2) in ttem number 22 by striking the project de-
seription and inserting “Redesign and reconstruction
of interchanges 298 and 299 of I-80 and accom-
panying vmprovements to any other public roads in
the vicinaty, Monroe County”.

SEC. 5. IDLING REDUCTION FACILITIES.

Section 111 of title 23, Unated States Code, 1s amended

by striking subsection (d).
SEC. 6. PROJECT AUTHORIZATIONS.
(a) IN GENERAL.—The table contained in section 1702

of the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation

*HR 1195 RS



97
1 Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1256) is amend-
2 ed—

3 (1) in item number 3688 by striking “road” and
4 mserting “trail”;
5 (2) in item number 3691 by striking the project
6 description and inserting “Hoonah roads”;
7 (3) in item number 3695 by striking “in
8 Soldotna” and inserting “in the Kenai River cor-
9 ridor’;
10 (4) wn item number 3699 by striking “to improve
11 fish habitat™;
12 (5) in item number 3700 by inserting “and ferry
13 Jfacilities” after “a ferry”;
14 (6) in item number 3703 by inserting “or other
15 roads” after “Cape Blossom Road’;
16 (7) an atem number 3704 by striking “Fair-
17 banks” and inserting “Alaska Highway™;
18 (8) in item number 3705 by striking “in Cook
19 Inlet for the Westside development/Williamsport-Pile
20 Bay Road” and inserting “for development of the
21 Williamsport-Pile Bay Road corridor’;
22 (9) an atem  number 3828 by  striking
23 “$2,000,000” and inserting “$11,000,000;
24 (10) by striking item number 3829;
25 (11) by striking item number 3832;

*HR 1195 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

98

(12) in item number 3861 by striking the project
description and inserting “Creation of a greenway
path along the Naugatuck River in Waterbury’;

(13) in item number 3883 by striking the project
description and inserting “Wilmington Riverfront Ac-
cess and Street Grid Redesign”;

(14) in item number 3892 by striking
“$5,000,000” and inserting “$8,800,000”;

(15) in  atem number 3894 by  striking
“$5,000,000” and inserting “$1,200,000”;

(16) in item nwmber 3909 by striking the project
description and inserting “S.R. 281, the Avalon Bou-
levard Expansion Project from Interstate 10 to U.S.
Highway 917

(17) in item number 3911 by striking the project
description and inserting “Construct a new bridge at
Indian Street, Martin County”;

(18) in item number 3916 by striking the project
description and inserting “City of Hollywood for U.S.
1/Federal Highway, north of Young Circle”;

(19) in item number 3937 by striking the project
description and inserting “Kingsland bypass from CR
61 to 1-95, Camden County’;

(20) in item number 3945 by striking “CR 293

to CS 52317 and inserting “SR 371 to SR 400”;

*HR 1195 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

99

(21) in item number 3965 by striking “transpor-
tation projects” and inserting “and air quality
projects”’;

(22) in item number 3986 by striking the project
description and inserting “Extension of Sugarloaf
Parkway, Gwinnett County’;

(23) in item number 3999 by striking “Bridges”
and inserting “Bridge and Corridor”;

(24) in item number 4003 by striking the project
description and inserting “City of Council Bluffs and
Pottawattamie County FEast Beltway Roadway and
Connectors Project’;

(25) in item number 4043 by striking “MP 9.3,
Segment I, II, and III” and inserting “Milepost
24.37:

(26) in item number 4050 by striking the project
description and inserting “Preconstruction and con-
struction activities of U.S. 51 between the Assumption
Bypass and Vandalia”;

(27) in item number 4058 by striking the project
description and inserting “For improvements to the
road between Brighton and Bunker Hill in Macoupin
County’;

(28) in item numbers 4062 and 4084 by striking

the project descriptions and mserting

*HR 1195 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

100

“Preconstruction, construction, and related research
and studies of 1-290 Cap the ITke project in the village
of Oak Park”;

(29) in item number 4089 by inserting “and
parking facility/entrance improvements serving the
Museum of Science and Industry” after “Lakeshore
Drive”;

(30) in item number 4103 by inserting “and ad-
jacent to the” before “Shawnee”;

(31) in item number 4110 by striking the project
description and inserting “For improvements to the
road between Brighton and Bunker Hill in Macoupin
Jounty”’;

(32) in item number 4120 by striking the project
description and amount and inserting “Upgrade
146th ~ Street  to  Improve 1-69 Access” and
“$800,000”, respectively;

(33) in atem  number 4125 by  striking
“$250,000” and inserting “$1,650,000”;

(34) by striking item number 4170;

(35) by striking item number 4179;

(36) in item number 4185 by striking the project
description and inserting “Replace the Clinton Street
Bridge spanning St. Mary’s River in downtown Fort

7 )
Wayne’;

*HR 1195 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = O

101

(37) in item number 4299 by striking the project
description and inserting “Improve U.S. 40, MD 715
wnterchange and other roadways in the vicinity of Ab-
erdeen  Proving Ground to support BRAC-related
growth’”;

(38) in item number 4313 by striking “Mary-
land Avenue” and all that follows through “Rd. cor-
ridor” and inserting “intermodal access and pedes-
trian safety improvements’;

(39) in atem number 4315 by  striking
“stormwater mitigation project” and inserting “envi-
ronmental preservation project”;

(40) in item number 4318 by striking the project
description and inserting “Planning, design, and con-
struction of improvements to the highway systems
connecting to Lewiston and Auburn downtowns”;

(41) in item nwmber 4323 by striking the project
description and inserting “MaineDOT Acadia inter-
modal passenger and maintenance facility’;

(42) in item number 4338 by striking the project
description and inserting “Construct 1 or more grade-
separated crossings of =75, and make associated 1m-
provements to 1mprove local and regional east-west

mobility between Mileposts 279 and 2827

*HR 1195 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

102

(43) in item number 4355 by striking the project
description and inserting “Design, engineering, ROW
acquisition, construction, and construction engineer-
g for the reconstruction of TH 95, from 12th Ave-
nue to CSAH 13, including bridge and approaches,
ramps, intersecting roadways, signals, turn lanes,
and multiuse trail, North Branch’;

(44) in item nwmber 4357 by striking the project
description and inserting “Design, construct, ROW,
and expand TH 241 and CSAH 35 and associated
streets in the City of St. Michael”;

(45) in item number 4360 by striking the project
description and inserting “Planning, design, and con-
struction for Twin Cities Bioscience Corridor in St.
Paul”;

(46) in item number 4362 by striking the project
description and inserting “I1-494/U.S. 169 inter-
change reconstruction including U.S. 169/Valley View
Road interchange, Twin Cities Metropolitan Area’;

(47) in item number 4365 by striking the project
description and inserting “34th Street realignment
and 34th Street and 1-94 interchange, including re-
tention and reconstruction of the SE Main Avenue/
CSAH 52 interchange ramps at 1-94, and other

transportation vmprovements for the city of Moor-

*HR 1195 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

| \O JEE \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e e e e e
A W O = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

103
head, including the SE Main Avenue GSI and Moor-

head Comprehensive Rail Safety Program™;

(48) in item number 4369 by striking the project
description and inserting “Construction of S8th Street
North, Stearns C.R. 120 to TH 15 in St. Cloud”;

(49) in item number 4371 by striking the project
description and inserting “Construction and ROW of
TH 241, CSAH 35 and associated streets in the City
of St. Michael”;

(50) in item number 4411 by  striking
“Southaven™ and inserting “DeSoto County™;

(51) in item number 4424 by striking the project
description and inserting “U.S. 93 Evaro to Polson
transportation improvement projects’;

(52) in item number 4428 by striking the project
description and inserting “US 76 improvements”;

(53) in item nwmber 4457 by striking the project
description and inserting “Construct an interchange
at an existing grade separation at SR 1602 (Old
Stantonsburg Rd.) and U.S. 264 Bypass in Wilson
County’;

(54) in item number 4461 by striking the project
description and inserting “Transportation and re-

lated improvements at Queens Unaversity of Char-

*HR 1195 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

| \O JEE \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e e e e e
A W O = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

104

lotte, including the Queens Science Center and the
Marion Diehl Center, Charlotte”;

(55) in item number 4507 by striking the project
description and inserting “Design, right-of-way and
construction of Highway 35 between Norfolk and
South Srvoux City, including an interchange at mile-
post 1 on U.S. I-1297;

(56) in item number 4555 by inserting “Canal
Street and” after “Reconstruction of”;

(57) in aitem number 4565 by striking the project
description and inserting “Railroad Construction and
Acquisition, Ely and White Pine County’;

(568) in item number 4588 by inserting “‘Private
Parking and” before “Transportation’;

(59) in item number 4596 by striking the project
description and inserting “Transportation center,
Corning’;

(60) in item number 4610, by striking the
project description and inserting “Demolition, site
restoration, and hazardous material abatement of
Alert Facility at Plattsburgh International Avrport”;

(61) in item number 4649 by striking the project
description and inserting “Fairfield County, OH

U.S. 33 and old U.S. 33 safety improvements and re-

*HR 1195 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

105
lated construction, city of Lancaster and surrounding
areas’’;

(62) in item number 4651 by striking “for the
transfer of rail to truck for the intermodal” and in-
serting “, and construction of an intermodal freight™;

(63) in item number 4691 by striking the project
description and inserting “Transportation improve-
ments to Idabel Industrial Park Rail Spur, Idabel’;

(64) in ttem number 4722 by striking the project
description and inserting “Highway, traffic, pedes-
trian, and riverfront improvements, Pittsburgh’;

(65) in item number 4749 by striking “study’
and inserting “improvements’’;

(66) in item number 4821 by striking “highway
grade crossing project, Clearfield and Clinton Coun-
ties” and inserting “Project for highway grade cross-
mgs and other purposes relating to the Project in
Cambria, Centre, Clearfield, Clinton, Indiana, and
Jefferson Counties™;

(67) in item number 4838 by striking “study”
and inserting “improvements’’;

(68) wn item number 4839 by striking fuel-
celled” and inserting “fueled’;

(69) in item number 4866 by  striking

“$11,000,000” and inserting “$9,400,000”;

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 9 N n B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

106
(70) by inserting after item number 4866 the fol-

lowing:

“48664 RI |  Repair and restore railroad $1,600,000”;

bridge in Westerly

(71) in item number 4892 by striking the project
description and inserting “Construct a 4-lane high-
way between maverick Junction and the Nebraska
border”;

(72) in item nwmber 4915 by striking the project
description and inserting “For projects of highest pri-
ority, as determined by the South Dakota DOT”;

(73)  an  atem  number 4916 by  striking
“$1,000,000” and inserting “$328,000”:

(74) in atem number 4924 by  striking
“$3,450,000” and inserting “$4,122,000”;

(75) in item number 4927 by striking the project
description and inserting “Construction and Im-
provements to the College Street Corridor, Great
Smoky Mountain Heritage Highway Cultural and
Visitors Center in Maryuville”;

(76) in item number 4960 by inserting “of which
$50,000 shall be used for a street paving project, Cal-
houn” after “County’;

(77) in item number 4974 by striking ©, Sevier

County’;

*HR 1195 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = O

107

(78) in item number 5008 by inserting “/Kane
Creek Boulevard™ after “500 West”;

(79) in item numbers 5011 and 5033 by striking
“200 South Interchange” each place it appears and
mserting “400 South Interchange’;

(80) in item number 5021, by striking “Pine
View Dam,”;

(81) in item nwmber 5026 by striking the project
description and inserting “Roadway improvements
on Washington Fields Road/300 East, Washington™;

113

(82) in item number 5027 by inserting “and
roadway improvements” after “safety project’;

(83) in item number 5028 by inserting “and
roadway improvements” after “lighting”;

(84) in aitem number 5029 by inserting “and
roadway improvements” after “lights”;

(85) in number 5032 by striking the project de-
seription and inserting “Expand Redhills Parkway,
St. George™;

(86) in item number 5132 by striking the project
description and inserting “St. Croix River crossing
project, Wisconsin State Highway 64, St. Croix

County, Wisconsin, to Minnesota State Highway 30,

Washington County’; and

*HR 1195 RS



O© o0 2 O WD B W N e

[\O I \© R \O I O N N e e e e e e T e e
W N = O O 0N N RN = O

108
(87) in item number 5161 by striking the project
description and inserting “Raleigh Street Extension

Project in Martinsburg”.

(b) TRANSFER OF PROJECT FUNDS.—The Secretary of
Transportation shall transfer to the Commandant of the
Coast Guard amounts made available to carry out the
project described in vtem number 4985 of the table contained
wm section 1702 of the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient
Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (119 Stat.
1447) to carry out that project, in accordance with the Act
of June 21, 1940 (commonly known as the “Truman-Hobbs
Act”) (33 U.S.C. 511 et seq.).

(¢) UNUSED OBLIGATION AUTHORITY.—Notwith-
standing any other provision of law, unused obligation au-
thority made available for an item in section 1702 of the
Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation Kq-
wity Act: A Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1256) that 1is re-
pealed, or authorized funding for such an item that is re-
duced, by this section shall be made available—

(1) for an item in section 1702 of that Act that

18 added or increased by this section and that is in

the same State as the item for which obligation au-

thority or funding is repealed or reduced;

*HR 1195 RS



11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

109

(2) in an amount proportional to the amount of
obligation authority or funding that is so repealed or
reduced; and

(3) individually for projects numbered 1 through
3676 pursuant to section 1102(c)(4)(A) of that Act
(119 Stat. 1158).

(d) ADDITIONAL DISCRETIONARY USE OF SURFACE

TRANSPORTATION PROGRAM FUNDS.—Of the funds appor-
tioned to each State under section 104(b)(3) of title 23,
Unated States Code, a State may expend for each of fiscal
years 2007 through 2009 not more than $1,000,000 for the

Jollowing activities:

(1) Participation in the Joint Operation Center

Jor  Fuel Compliance established —under  section

143(b)(4)(H) of title 23, Unated States Code, within
the Department of the Treasury, including the fund-
mg of additional positions for motor fuel tax enforce-
ment officers and other staff dedicated on a full-time
basis to participation wn the activities of the Center.

(2) Development, operation, and maintenance of
electronic filing systems to coordinate data exchange
with the Internal Revenue Service by States that im-
pose a tax on the removal of taxable fuel from any
refinery and on the removal of taxable fuel from any

termanal.

*HR 1195 RS



110

1 (3) Development, operation, and maintenance of
2 electronic single point of filing i conjunction with
3 the Internal Revenue Service by States that impose a
4 tax on the removal of taxable fuel from any refinery
5 and on the removal of taxable fuel from any terminal.
6 (4) Development, operation, and maintenance of
7 a certification system by a State of any fuel sold to
8 a State or local government (as defined in section
9 4221(d)(4) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986) for
10 the exclusive use of the State or local government or
11 sold to a qualified volunteer fire department (as de-
12 Jined in section 150(e)(2) of such Code) for its exclu-
13 stve use.

14 (5) Development, operation, and maintenance of
15 a certification system by a State of any fuel sold to
16 a nonprofit educational organization (as defined in
17 section  4221(d)(5) of such Code) that includes
18 verification of the good standing of the organization
19 wm the State in which the organization is providing
20 educational services.
21 SEC. 7. CORRECTION OF INTERSTATE DESIGNATION.

22 (a) TREATMENT.—Section 1908(a) of the Safe, Ac-
23 countable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity Act: A
24 Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1469) is amended by striking

25 paragraph (3).

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N B W =

|\ I N© TR NG T NS R NS R e e T e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = O

111

(b) NATIONAL HIGHWAY SYSTEM.—Section 1908(b) of
the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation
Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1470) 1s amend-
ed by striking “from the Arkansas State line” and inserting
“from Interstate Route 5407
SEC. 8. FUTURE OF SURFACE TRANSPORTATION SYSTEM.

Section 1909(b) of the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Effi-
cient Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (119
Stat. 1471) s amended—

(1) in the matter preceding subparagraph (4) of
paragraph (9) by striking “July 1, 2007” and insert-
g “December 31, 2007";

(2) wn paragraph (11)(C) by striking “the Ad-
manistrator of the Federal Highway Admainistration”
and inserting “the Secretary’;

(3) wn paragraph (11)(D)(i) by striking “, on a
revmbursable basis,”;

(4) in paragraph (15) by striking “$1,400,000
Jor each of fiscal years 2006 and 2007” and inserting
“$1,400,000 for fiscal year 2006 and $3,400,000 for
fiscal year 20077;

(5) by redesignating paragraphs (14), (15), (16),
and (17) as paragraphs (15), (16), (17), and (18), re-

spectively; and

*HR 1195 RS



O© o0 3 O WD A W N -

[\ I \© R \O I O R S e e e e e e T e e
W = O O 0N N R WD = O

24
25

112
(6) by inserting after paragraph (13) the fol-
lowing:
“(14) LIMITATIONS.—

“(A) FUNDS.—Funds made avarlable to
carry out this section may be expended only to
support the activities of the Commaission.

“(B) DATA, ANALYSES, AND REPORTS.—No
data, analysis, report, or other docwment pre-
pared for the Commaission to fulfill the duties of
the Commaission may be provided to, or shared
with, any other commassion or task force until
the data, analysis, report, or document has been
made available to the public.”.

SEC. 9. BUDGET JUSTIFICATION.

Section 1926 of the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Effi-
cient Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (49
U.S.C. 301 note; 119 Stat. 1483) is amended by striking
“The Department” and inserting “Notwithstanding any
other provision of law, the Department”.

SEC. 10. BUY AMERICA.

Section 1928 of the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Effi-
cient Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (119
Stat. 1484) s amended—

(1) by redesignating paragraphs (2) through (5)
as paragraphs (3) through (6), respectively; and

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N Bk W =

[a—
@)

1
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21

[E—

22
23
24
25

113

(2) by inserting after paragraph (1) the fol-
lowing:

“(2) the current application by the Federal
Highway Admanistration of the Buy America test as
applied only to components or parts of a bridge
project and mnot the entire bridge project s incon-
sistent with this sense of Congress;”.

SEC. 11. TRANSPORTATION IMPROVEMENTS.

The table contained in section 1934(c) of the Safe, Ac-
countable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity Act: A
Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1486) is amended—

(1) in atem number 12 by striking “Yukon
River” and inserting “Kuskokwim River”;

(2) in item number 18 by striking “Engineering
and Construction in Merced County” and inserting
“and safety improvements/realignment of SR 165
project study report and environmental studies in
Merced and Stanislaus Counties”;

(3) wn ttem number 38 by striking the project de-
seription and inserting “Relocation of the Newark
Train Station”;

(4) wn ttem number 57 by striking the project de-
seription and inserting “Kingsland bypass from CR
61 to 1-95, Camden County’;

(5) an item nwmber 114—

*HR 1195 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

114
(A) by striking “IA-327; and
(B) by inserting “SW”” after “Construct”;

(6) in ttem number 122 by striking the project
description and inserting “Design, right-of-way, and
construction of the SW Arterial and connections to
U.S. 20, Dubuque County’;

(7) in atem number 130 by striking the project
description and inserting “Improvements and reha-
bilitation to rail and bridges on the Appanoose Coun-
ty Communaty Railroad”;

(8) in item number 133 by striking “IA-327;

(9) in item number 138 by striking the project
description and inserting “West Spencer Beltway
Project”;

(10) in item number 142 by striking “MP 9.3,
Segment I, II, and III” and inserting “Milepost

(11) wn ttem number 161 by striking “Bridge re-
placement on Johnson Drive and Nall Ave.” and in-
serting “Construction improvements”;

(12) in item number 182 by striking the project
description and inserting “Improve U.S. 40, M.D.
715 anterchange, and other roadways wn the vicinity
of Aberdeen Proving Ground to support BRAC-related

growth’;

*HR 1195 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

115

(13) in item number 198 by striking the project
description and inserting “Construct 1 or more grade
separated crossings of 1-75 and make associated 1m-
provements to improve local and regional east-west
mobility between Mileposts 279 and 2827’

(14) in item number 201 by striking the project
description and inserting “Alger County, paving a
portion of H=58 from Buck Hill to a point located
4,000 feet east of the Hurricane River”;

(15) in item number 238 by striking the project
description and inserting “Develop and construct the
St. Mary water project road and bridge infrastruc-
ture, including a new bridge and approaches across
St. Mary River, stabilization and improvements to
United States Route 89, and road/canal from Siphon
Bridge to Spider Lake, on the condition that
$2,500,000 of the amount made available to carry out
this item may be made available to the Bureauw of
Reclamation for use for the Swift Current Creek and
Boulder Creek bank and bed stabilization project in
the Lower St. Mary Lake drainage’;

(16) in ttem number 329 by inserting *, Tulsa”
after “technology’;

(17) in atem number 358 by striking fuel-

celled” and inserting “‘fueled”;

*HR 1195 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N -

[\© TN O T N T NG R NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
L A W NN = DO VO X NN R WD = O

116
(18) in item number 374 by striking the project
description and inserting “Construct a 4-lane high-
way between Maverick Junction and the Nebraska
border”; and
(19) in item number 402 by striking ‘‘from 2 to

5 lanes and vmprove alignment within rights-of-way

wm St. George” and inserting ©, St. George”.
SEC. 12. HIGHWAY RESEARCH FUNDING.

(a) F-SHRP FUNDING.—Notwithstanding any other
provision of law, for each of fiscal years 2007 through 2009,
at any time at which an apportionment is made of the sums
authorized to be appropriated for the surface transportation
program, the congestion mitigation and air quality im-
provement program, the National Highway System, the
Interstate maintenance program, the bridge program, or the
highway  safety improvement program, the Secretary of
Transportation shall—

(1) deduct from each apportionment an amount
not to exceed 0.205 percent of the apportionment; and
(2) transfer or otherwise make that amount
available to carry out section 510 of title 23, United

States Code.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—

(1) FUNDING.—Section 5101 of the Safe, Ac-

countable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity

*HR 1195 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\O I O R i e e e e e e e T
—_— O O o0 N N O nm R~ WD = O

22

117
Act: A Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1779) is amend-

ed—
(A) in subsection (a)(1) by striking “509,

and 5107 and inserting “and 509

(B) in subsection (a)(4) by striking

“$69,700,000” and all that follows through

“2009” and inserting “$40,400,000 for fiscal

year 2005, $69,700,000 for fiscal year 2006,

$76,400,000 for each of fiscal years 2007 and

2008, and $78,900,000 for fiscal year 20097; and

(C) wn subsection (b) by inserting “or, in

the case of funds appropriated by subsection (a)

to carry out section 5201, 5202, or 5203, 80 per-

cent” after “50 percent”.

(2) FUTURE STRATEGIC HIGHWAY RESEARCH
PROGRAM.—Section 5210 of the Safe, Accountable,
Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity Act: A Leg-
acy for Users (119 Stat. 1804) s amended—

(A) by striking subsection (c); and
(B) by redesignating subsection (d) as sub-
section (c).

(¢) CONTRACT AUTHORITY.—Funds made avarlable

23 under this section shall be available for obligation in the

24 same manner as if the funds were apportioned under chap-

*HR 1195 RS



O© 00 3 O WD A W N e

[\ I NS R T e e T e T e T e T T T
—_— O O o0 N N O nm R~ WD = O

22
23

118
ter 1 of title 23, United States Code, except that the Federal

share shall be determined under section 510(f) of that title.

(d) APPLICABILITY OF OBLIGATION LIMITATION.—
Funds made available under this section shall be subject
to any limitation on obligations for Federal-avd highways
and highway safety construction programs under section
1102 the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient Transpor-
tation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (23 U.S.C. 104 note;
119 Stat. 1157) or any other Act.

(e) EQuity BONUS FOrRMULA.—Notwithstanding any
other provision of law, i allocating funds for the equity
bonus program under section 105 of title 2.3, United States
Code, for each of fiscal years 2007 through 2009, the Sec-
retary of Transportation shall make the required calcula-
tions under that section as if this section had not been en-
acted.

(f) FUNDING FOR RESEARCH ACTIVITIES.—Of the
amount made available by section 5101(a)(1) of the Safe,
Accountable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity Act:
A Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1779)—

(1) at least $1,000,000 shall be made available

Jor each of fiscal years 2007 through 2009 to carry

out section 502(h) of title 23, United States Code; and

*HR 1195 RS



O© 00 2 O WD A W N e

O TN NG T N T NG N NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e
[ B N U N N = = N R - BN B o) W ) B ~S O T NO S e

119
(2) at least $4,900,000 shall be made available

Jor each of fiscal years 2007 through 2009 to carry

out section 502(v) of that title.
(9) TECHINICAL AMENDMENTS.—

(1) SURFACE TRANSPORTATION RESEARCH.—
Section 502 of title 23, Unated States Code, 1s amend-

ed by striking the first subsection (h), relating to in-

Jrastructure investment needs reports beginning with

the report for January 31, 1999.

(2) ADVANCED TRAVEL FORECASTING PROCE-
DURES PROGRAM.—Section 5512(a)(2) of the Safe,
Accountable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation FEq-
wity Act: A Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1829) 1is
amended by striking “PROGRAM APPRECIATION.—
and inserting “PROGRAM APPLICATION.—".

(3) UNIVERSITY TRANSPORTATION RESEARCH.—
Section 5506 of title 49, United States Code, is
amended—

(A) in subsection (i)—
(1) by striking “In order to” and in-
serting the following:

“(1) IN GENERAL.—In order to”; and

(11) by adding at the end the following:

“(2) SPECIAL RULE.—Nothing in paragraph (1)

requires a nonprofit institution of higher learning

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e T T
[ B NG U N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O I NO S e

120

designated as a Tier II university transportation cen-
ter to mawntain total expenditures as described in
paragraph (1) in excess of the amount of the grant
awarded to the institution.”; and
(B) in subsection (k)(3) by striking “The
Secretary” and all that follows through “to carry
out this section” and inserting “For each of fis-
cal years 2007 through 2009, the Secretary shall
expend not more than 1.5 percent of amounts
made available to carry out this section”.
SEC. 13. RESCISSION.

Section 10212 of the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Effi-
cient Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (as
amended by section 1302 of the Pension Protection Act of
2006 (Public Law 109-280)) (119 Stat. 1937: 120 Stat.
780) 1s amended by striking “$8,593,000,000” each place
it appears and inserting “$8,710,000,0007.

SEC. 14. TEA-21 TECHNICAL CORRECTIONS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 1108(f)(1) of the Transpor-

tation Equity Act for the 21st Century (23 U.S.C. 133 note;

112 Stat. 141) 1is amended by striking “2003” and inserting

“2009”.
(b) BEARTOOTH HIGHWAY, WYOMING AND MON-
TANA.—Item number 1646 of the table contained in section

1602 of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 N N Bk W

| \O JEE \© R O R \O B O R e T e e e e T e e e e
A W D= O O 0NN N N R WD = O

121
(112 Stat. 317) is amended in the project description by

striking “and construction” and inserting “reconstruction,

maintenance (including routine and preventive mainte-

nance), snow removal, and pavement preservation”.

SEC. 15. HIGH PRIORITY CORRIDOR AND INNOVATIVE
PROJECT TECHNICAL CORRECTIONS.

(a) HicH PRIORITY CORRIDORS.—Section 1105(c) of
the Intermodal Surface Transportation Efficiency Act of
1991 (105 Stat. 2032; 119 Stat. 1212) is amended—

(1) i paragraph (63) by striking “and Unated

States Routes 1, 3, 9, 17, and 46,” and inserting

“Unated States Routes 1, 9, and 46, and State Routes

3and 17,”; and

(2) in paragraph (64)—

(A) by striking “United States Route 427
and inserting “State Route 427; and

(B) by striking “Interstate Route 6767 and
mserting “Interstate Routes 76 and 6767

(b) INNOVATIVE PROJECTS.—The table contained in
section 1107(b) of the Intermodal Surface Transportation
Efficiency Act of 1991 (105 Stat. 2048(b)) s amended in
item number 89, in the matter under the column with the
heading “INNOVATIVE PROJECTS”, by inserting “and con-

tiguous counties” after “Michigan”.

*HR 1195 RS



122
1 SEC. 16. DEFINITION OF REPEAT INTOXICATED DRIVER

LAW.
Section 164(a)(5) of title 23, United States Code, s

amended by striking subparagraphs (A) and (B) and in-

2

3

4

5 serting the following:
6 “(A) receive—

7 “(1) a drver’s license suspension for
8 not less than 1 year; or

9

“(11) a combination of suspension of all

10 driving privileges for the first 45 days of
11 the suspension period followed by a rein-
12 statement of lLimited driving privileges for
13 the purpose of getting to and from work,
14 school, or an alcohol treatment program if
15 an ignition interlock device 1s nstalled on
16 each of the motor vehicles owned or oper-
17 ated, or both, by the individual;

18 “(B) be subject to the impoundment or vm-
19 mobilization of, or the installation of an ignition
20 terlock system on, each motor vehicle owned or
21 operated (or both) by the individual;”.

22 SEC. 17. RESEARCH TECHNICAL CORRECTION.

23 Section 5506(e)(5)(C) of title 49, Unated States Code,
24 us  amended by striking  “$2,225,000”and  inserting
25 “$2 950,000,

*HR 1195 RS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[\O 2 \© R O R O S e e e e e e D e e
W N = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

123
SEC. 18. EFFECTIVE DATE.

(a) IN GENERAL—ZExcept as otherwise provided in
this Act (tncluding subsection (b)), this Act and the amend-
ments made by this Act take effect on the date of enactment
of this Act.

(b) EXCEPTION.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The amendments made by
this Act (other than the amendments made by sections
4, 6, and 11) to the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Kffi-
cient Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users
(Public Law 109-59; 119 Stat. 1144) shall—

(A) take effect as of the date of enactment
of that Act; and

(B) be treated as being included in that Act
as of that date.

(2) EFFECT OF AMENDMENTS.—FEach provision
of the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient Transpor-
tation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (Public Law
109-59; 119 Stat. 1144) (including the amendments
made by that Act) (as in effect on the day before the
date of enactment of this Act) that is amended by this
Act (other than sections 4, 6, and 11) shall be treated

as not being enacted.

*HR 1195 RS



Calendar No. 608

11070 CONGRESS
2D SESSION :. zo ﬂ ﬂ wm

AN ACT

To amend the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient
Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users
to make technical corrections, and for other pur-
poses.

MarcH 7, 2008

Reported with an amendment



